DISTRICT COURTS AMENDMENT

WESTERN SAMOA

of Provisions

Arrangement

r

Title 1. Penalty for failure 10 camply with
1. Short Title and ¢commencement ‘ witness summons
2. Altering Short Fitle of principal i5. Right to appeal
Act and amending Acts 1. Security for appeal’
5 Inicrpretation 17 Warrant of distress
4. Courts constituted 18.  Penalty for rescue of goods seired
5. Qath of Office 19. 7 Absconding defendant
0. Lxtending general civil - 20, Compensation
jurisdiction of District Cournt 21, Security for costs
Jadges 22, Penalty for resisting or
7. Bxtending general civil obstructing officer
jurisdiction of Fa’amasino 23, Misconduct of Officers
Fesvasoani 24, Officers of Court not o acl as
8. Jurisdiction in proceedings under solicitors therein
the Customs Act 1977 25.  Proof of service of documents
u. Extendingeriminal jurisdictionol 36, Constables to assist Courl
Fa’amasino ' 27.  Lxtending jurisdiction under
10, ‘T'ramsfer to Supreme Court of ather Acts
proceedings within jurisdiction 28, References Lo Magistrate's
1. Transfer of procecdings [rom Courts cte.. deemed references to
High Court to Disteict Court District Courts
12 Interpleader 29, Transitional provisions
13, Equity and good conscience Schedule

1992/1993, No.

11

AN ACT to amend the Act heretofore known as the

Magistrates’ Courts Act 1969:

BE IT ENACTED by the Legislative Assembly of Western

1.

Samoa in Parliament

assembled as follows:-

Short Title and commencement - (1) This Act may be

cited as the District Courts Amendment 1992/1993 and shall be

.




2
read together with and deemed part of the Act herctolore
known as Lthe Magistrates”  Courls  Act 1969 (hercinalter
referred Lo as Lhc_'princi-pul Act), |

.(2) This Acl shall é()n]mencc on such date as shafl be

appointed by the Head of State acting on the advice ol

Cabinet, by Order.

2. Altering Short Ti.tle of principal Act and amending
Acts- .('l). lThc principal Act m'ay herealter be cited as lhé
District Courls Amendment Act 1969.

(2) The Short Title of the principal Act and the Short
Titles of the Ac.ts specified in the Schedule to this Act are
hereby consequentially amended, in cach ‘cuf,c,_by omitting the
word "Magistrates’™, and substituting the word "District”.

(3) ]Every refercnee inr any enactment to any of Lhe said
Acts is hereby consequentially amended by omitting the word

"Magistrales™, and substituting the word "District”.

3. Interpretation - (1); Subsection (1) of scection 2 ol the
principal Act is hereby amended by omitting the definition of
the terms "Court" and "Mégistrate’s Court”, and substituting the
[ollowing definitions:

" "Courl” or "District Court" means a District Court of
Western Samoa constituted under this Act:”
(2) The sairj subsection ‘(1) of section 2 is further

amended by omitting the definition of the term "Magistrate”




3

and substituting in -ds proper  alphabetical  position  the
lollowing delinition:-
“Judge” means a District Court Judge appointed under

this Act:".

4. Courts constituted - (1) The principal Act is hercby
amended by omitting from Part 1f the subheading "Magisirates’

Courts”, and by repealing section 3, and substituting the

following subheading and section:

"District Courts"
“3. Courts constituted - (1) There shall continue to be
within  Western  Samoa subordinate  Courts ol record,
possessing civil and criminal jurisdiction, hencelorth to be
calted District Cou'rts.oi' Western Samoa.

(2) The Head of State, acting on the advice of Cabinet,
may at any time by Order subdivide any District Court
and create separate District Courts.

(3) Each Courl shéll have a seal, which shall be kept by
the Registrar.”

{2) Every Court constituted as a Magistrates’ Court
immediately before the commencement ol this Act, shall

continue to be constituted as a District Courl under the

principal Act as amended by this Act.




5. OQath of Office - (1) The principal Act is further
amended by inserting immediately alter section 10 the
“Tollowing ncu.'.seclion,- to be known uas section 10A:-

"10A. Oath of Q‘t‘l‘ice - (1) An oath in the form appear-
ing in subsection (3) of this _scéli()n shall be wken by
every Distriet. Court Judge and Fa'umasino Fesoasoani,
or acting District Court Judge or Fa'amasino Fosoasoant,
as soon as may be after his acceptance of office, or as the
case may _lpc alter the commencement of this section and
no District Court Judge and Fa’amasino Fesoasoani, or
acting District Court Judge or Fa’amasino Fesoasoani,
shall enter on his office or as the case may bl, continue
in his office until he has taken the same.

(2) The oath o be taken under this section shall be

administered by a District Court Judge, or il no District
Courl Judge is availéble for that purposc, by a Judge of
the Suprcrﬁe Courl.

(3) The oath referrcd to in subsgclion (]) of this section

shall be in the following form:-

[,ieieeieee . syvear by Aimigh[y God that T will well and

truly serve the Independent Statc ol Western Samoa in

the office of e Lin  accordance wi.th the

Constitution and the law; and 1 will do right to all

manner of people, wifhoul fear or lavour, affection or

ill witl"




-

5.
Judges

(a)

{h)

(c)
{d}

(¢)

()

(g)

7.

.

T
——— e

Extending general civil jurisdiction of District Court
- (1) The principal Act is further amended

By on'ailt.ing from scetion 23 the expression "$1,000° in
both places where it occurs, and substituting in cach
casc the cxpression "$10,000™

By omitting from paragraph (b) ol section 24 the
expression "$1,0007, and substituting  the cxpression
"$10,000m:

B.y omitfing [rom scction 25 the expression "$1,0007,
and substituting the cxpression "$](}0.[)0()":

By further omitting from scction 25 the cxpression
"$100", and substitu.ting the expression "$10,000%

By omitting {rom section-ZS the expression "$1,000" in
every place where ii occltrs, and substituling in each
-case the expression ”$]0,0()Q":

By omitting from section 29 the expression "$1,000” in
cvery place where it occurs, ;md substituting the
cxpression "$10,000™

By omi!;ting from section 27 of the principal Act the
cxpression "$1,000", and substituting the expression

"$10,000",

Extending general civil jurisdiction of Fa’amasino

Fesoasoani - (1) The principal Act is further amended -

(a)

By omitting from section 33 the expression "$40" in

- both places where it occurs, and substituting in cach




case the cxpression "$1,0007
{b) .By omitting [from paragraphs (a) of scetion 34 the
cxpression  "$40° and “substituting  (he c¢xpression

"$2,000™.

3. Jurisdiction in proceedings under the Customs Act 1977-
Section 37 of the principal Act is repealed and the following
scction is substituted:-

37. Jurisdiction in proce‘edings under the Customs Act

1977 - A Court presided over byf-' a District C()uﬁ Judge

shall have jurisdiction l.o hear and determine  any

proceedings commenced under the Customs Act 1977

Provided that the amount claimed or the value of the
goods does not exceed 310,000 and that in any criminal
procecdlings the maximum pcnal[y‘clncs not exceed 3 years'

imprisonment."

9. Extending criminal  jurisdiction of Fa’amasino
Fesoasoani- (1) Scction 38 of the principal Act is amcnded by
omitting the expression "$40" and substituting the cxpression
"$!'L,()()O"..
| (2) Section 39 of the principal Act is amended by::

(a) Omitting Ifrom paragraﬁh (a) the expression "$200” and

substituting the -cxpressién "$1,000"

(b) Omitting from paragréph (b) the expression "$40" and

substituting the expression "$1,000".




7
(3) Paragraph (b) ol section 40 of the principal Act is
amended by omitting the expression "$100" and
Suhslilulin_g the expression "'I$‘l_.(l(}0"."
10, * Transfer to Supreme .Court of proceedings w.ithin

jurisﬁclion -{1) Section 48 of the principal Act is amended by
omitting from subsection (1), and also Irom subsection (2), the
expression "$4007, and substituting in cach casc the expression
"$5,000"

11. Transfer of proceedings from Supreme Court to
District Court- The principal Act is h.ereby amended by
repealing section 51, and substituting the-lollowing section:

51. Transfer of proceedings from Supreme Court to

Distriet Court - I, where civil proceedings huve been

commenced in the Supreme Courl, -

{a) An agreement is madce under the prm-'is;ions of
section 35 of this Act that a District Courl shall
have j'urisdiction; or

(b) The subject-matter ol the proceedings is within the
jurisdiction of District Courls, -

the Supreme Court or a .ludé_c ol that Court .may. on the

application of any party to the proccedings. order that the

proccedings be transferred to a District Courl”

12. Interpleader - Section 54 of the principal Act is
amended by omitting the expression '$1,000", and substituting

the expression -"$10_,000".

s

|




13. Equity and good conscience - Scc_lion 56 ol the
principal Act is amended -
(¢) By omitting the expression "$100" and substituting the
cxpression "$1,000";
{(b) By omitting the expression "$40" and substituting (he

cxpression “$1,000"

14. Penalty for failing to comply with witness summons -
Scction 58 of the pri.ncipal Aci is amended -
(¢) By omitting from subsection (1) the expression "$40"
and substituting the expression "$500";
(b) By omitting from subsection (2) the expression *"$40”

and substituting the expression "$500":

15. Right to appeal - Section 70 of the principal Acl is
amended by omitting the expression "$40" in both places where

it occurs, and substituting in each case the expression "$1,000"

16. Security for appeal - Subsection (2) of section 72 of
the principal Actl is amended by omitting the expression "$50

and substituting the expression “$200".

17. Warrant of distress - Paragraph (a) of subsection (1)
of section 87 of the principal Act is amended by omitting the

expression "$100" and substituting the expression "$1,000".




9

18. Penalty for rescue of goods siezed - Scction 90 ol the
principal Acl is amended by omitting the expression "$407 und

substituting the cxpression "$500".

19. Absconding defendant - Subsection (1) of scetion 104
of the principal Act is amended by omitting the expression

"$40" and substituting the expression "$300".
20. Compensation . - Paragraph (b) of section 1035 is
amended by omitling the cxpression "$40" and Suhsli[uling the

expression "$500".

21. Security for costs - Subsection (1) of section 112 of the

principal Actis amended by omitting the expression "$100" and '

substituling the expression "$300".

22. Penalty for reSisting or obstructing officer - Scction
115 of the principal Act is amended by omitting the expression

"$40" and substituting the expression "$300".

23. Misconduct of Officers -Subsecction (3) of section 116
of the principal Act is amended by omitting the expression

"$40", and substituting the expression "$500".

24, Officers of Court not to act as solicitors therein -

Subsection (2) of section ‘117 of the principal Act is amended

1
f
|




10
by omitting  the expression  “$20°, and  substituting  the

expression "§500"

25. Proof of service of documents - Subscction (2) of
scction 131 of the principal Act is amended by omitting the

expression "$400" and substituting the cxpression "$1.000”

26. Constables to assist Court - Subscction (1) of section
135 is amended by omitting the cexpression "$10°. und

substituting the cxpression "$500".

27. Extending jurisdiction under other Acts - (1) The
Property Law Act 1952 (N.Z) (as amcnded by the Decimal
Currency Act 1966) as it applies in Western Samoa shall be read
and construed as if -

(1) the expression "$4,000" where it appears in section 143
were omitted and the expression "$10,000" substituted
therefor.

"(b) the expression "$10,000° where it appears in paragraph
{a) of subscction 6 of section 152 were omitted and
the expression "$10,000” substituted therelor.

{2) Paragraph (b) of subseclion 2 of section 112 of the
Criminal Procedure Act 1972 is amended by omitting the
expression’ "$500" and substjtuting the expression "$2,000".

3) Subse_ction 3 of section 112 of the Criminal Procedure

Act 1972 is amended by omitting the expression "$500" and




substituting the expression "$2,000"

28. References to Magistrates Courts, ete., deemed
references to District Courts - (1) Every relcrence 1o a
Magistrate’s Court in the principal Act or any other enactment
specificd in the Schedule to this Acl. shall be deemed lor all
purposes 1o Be a reference 1o a Distriet Court, and cvery such
reference to a Magistrate shall be deemed Tor all purposes 10 be
4 rcfcrcﬁcc Lo a District Court Judge.

(2) Every reference to a Magistrate’s  Courl in any
enactment  {other than one to which subsccltion (1) of this
section applics) passed before the date of the commencement
of this section or in any document executed before that date,
shall be deemed lor all purposes 1o be a relerence o a District
Court, and cvery such relerence to a Magistrate  shall be
deemed lor all purposes Lo be a relerence to a District Court

Judge.

29. Transitional provisions - (1) Every person who,
immediately before the commencement ol this Act, was
holding office as a Magistrate or an acting Magistrate pursuant
to section 5 or section 10 of the principal Act shall be deemed
for all purposes to have been appointed to be a District Courl
Judge, or, as the case may be, an acting District Court Judge
and his commission shall be c.onstrued accordingly.

(2) Bvery person who, immediately = before the




2
commencement of this Act, was holding olfice as o Fa'amasino
Fesoasoant  or an acting Fa'amasino  Fesoasoani  pursuant o
section 6 oor seetion 10 ot the principal Act shall be deemed for
al purpusu.\. to huve been appointed o be a Fu'mnztﬁiﬁn
Fesoasoani  of the District Court or, as the case may be, an
acting Fa’amasino Fesoasoani of Lhe District Court and his
commiss}nn shall hé construed accordingly.

(3) Every person  who, immediately  before  the
commencement ol this Act, was holding office as o Registrar
or Deputy Registrar or an officer of a Magistrate’s Court shall
be deemed for all purposes to have been appointed to be a
Registrar or Deputy Registrar or an officer of a District Cotrt.

(4) Any form that was printed, before the commencement
of this Act. in the form prescribed by or under, and for the
purposes of, the principal Act or any other cnactment may be
used for such purposes after the commencement of this section,
and it shall not be nccessary, merely because of any ol the
provisions of this Actl, to aller any printed material in any

i
such lorm.

SCHEDULE Sections 2, 28
ENACTMENTS AMENDED BY ALTERING SHORT TITLES

Magistrates” Courts Amendment Act 1972

Magistrates’ Courts Amendment Act 1976




