
(34) 

248 

(2) The Passport Officer shall not replace a lost, 
stolen or damaged Certjficate of Identity until he 
is satisfied that the owner of such Certificate of 
Identity has taken every reasonable steps to 
recover it. 

(3) Application for the replacement of a lost, stolen 

SOLOMON ISLANDS INDEPENDENCE ORDER 1978 
(L.N NO. 43 OF 1978) 

THE MEMBERS OF PARLIAMENT (ENTITLEMENTS) 
COMMISSION (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2000 

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 69B.(2) of the 
Constitution, the Members of Parliament (Entitlements) 
Commission hereby makes the following regulations ~ 

{ 



, 

249 

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Members of 
.Parliament (Entitlements) Commission (Amendment) 
Regulations 2000, and shall come into force on the 1 st 
day pf April 2000. 

2. Regulations 9(3)(b)(i) of the Members of Parliament 
(Entitlements) Commission Regulations 1988 (here 
inafter referred to as the "principal Regulations") is 
hereby amended by deleting the words "twenty-five" 
that appears therein and inserting therefor the words 
"fifty". 

3. Regulation 11 (1) of the principal Regulations is hereby 
amended by deleting the second sentence thereof and 
substituting therefor the following _ 

"The Terminal Grant shall be paid immediately upon the 
death or resignation of a member." 

4. Regulation I1B(l) of the principal Regulations is hereby 
amended by deleting the figure '20%" thereof and 
substituting therefor the figure "25%". 

5. Regulation llB of the principal Regulations is hereby 
amended by inserting after regulation 11B(3) a new 
regulation IIB(3)(i) as follows-

"1. IIB(3)(i) A member who had served in Parliament 
for an aggregate period of 16 years shall be entitled to a 
life pension of 45% of the current annual basic salary of 
a member." 

6. Regulation 12(1) of the principal Regulations is hereby 
amended by deleting the figure "$ 10,000" thereof and 
substituting therefor the figure "$15,000·'. 

7. Regulation 33 of the principal Regulations is hereby 
amended by deleting the figure "$30.00" thereof and 
substituting therefor the figure "$50.00". 

8. Paragraph 8(a) of Appendix A of the principal Regula­
tions is hereby amended by inserting the word "taxable" 



250 

between the words"'hourly" and "rate", and by deleting 
the figure "$10.00" thereof and substituting therefor the 
figure "$30.00". 

9. Appendix A3 of the principal Regulations is hereby 
amended by designating the initials "USD" before the 
amounts listed therein. 

1 O. In pursuance of section 25 of the Provincial Government 
Act (Cap. lIS), Legal Notice No. 86 is hereby amended 
by deleting items (a) and (b) thereof and substituting 
therefor the following -

"~. SALARY FOR ALL PROVINCE 

DESIGNATION $(per annum) $(per month) 

Premier 18,996 1,583 
Deputy Premier 15,996 1,333 
Executive Members 14,916 . 1,243 
Members 9,996 833 
Deputy speaker 12,000 1.000." 

Made at Honiara this thirty-first'day of March 2000. 

C.R.DARCY 
Chainnan 

Members of Parliament (Entitlements) Conunission 

Honiara, Solomon Islands 
Printed under the authority of the 

Solomon Islands Government 
Published by Solomon Island Printers Ltd 

( 

\ 




