549
EXTRAORDINARY

GOVERNMENT OF FIJI GAZETTE SUPPLEMENT

No. 60 FRIDAY, 3rd DECEMBER 2021

[LEGAL NOTICE No. 131]

HOTELS AND GUEST HOUSES ACT 1973

Hotels and Guest Houses (Amendment) Regulations
2021

IN exercise of the powers conferred on me by section 13 of the Hotels and Guest Houses
Act 1973, 1 hereby make these Regulations—

Short title and commencement
1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Hotels and Guest Houses (Amendment)
Regulations 2021.

(2) These Regulations come into force on the date the Hotels and Guest Houses
(Amendment) Act 2021 comes into force.

(3) In these Regulations, the Hotels and Guest Houses Regulations 1974 is referred
to as the “Principal Regulations”.



550

Schedule 1 amended
2. Schedule 1 to the Principal Regulations is amended in item 4, paragraph (d) by
deleting “$55” and substituting “$50 (VAT Exclusive)”.
Schedule 3 amended
3. Schedule 3 to the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “one year” and
substituting “.......... year(s)”.
Schedule 4 amended
4. The Principal Regulations are amended by deleting Schedule 4 and substituting
the following—
“SCHEDULE 4
(Regulation 7)

FEES PAYABLE ON GRANT OR RENEWAL OF LICENCE

Number 1-year 2-year 3-year 4-year 5-year
of beds licence licence licence licence licence
(VAT Exclusive) | (VAT Exclusive) | (VAT Exclusive) | (VAT Exclusive) | (VAT Exclusive)
1-50 $250 $500 $750 $1,000 $1,250
51 -300 $500 $1,000 $1,500 $2,000 $2,500
301 and $1,000 $2,000 $3,000 $4,000 $5,000 ”
above

Made this 3rd day of December 2021.

A.SAYED-KHAIYUM

Attorney-General






