
---·· ---===-· -~ ~-'='"·~ -~=-=···=···7:-.. ~ :-:=~= 
. ··-----:-:=::-- ... ···-·· - · . . .... . . ···-· -·· . - ~-- - - - ' - · .. '.':'"""--:==:- . - .. -.• - - .::::--~------- -. 

FIJI 

3 1 DEC 186 
g~~l 
~~tl"-€.c:f. 

ACT No. 2S OF 1986 443 

~-► 

-~ f. 

·.-,., ') ,.,,,, • ...,,._=._, 

I assent. 

[LS.) P. K. GANILAU 

Governor-Genera I 

16th December 1986 

AN ACT 

TO AMEND THE INCOME TAX ACT Cop. 201 

ENACTED by the Parliament of Fiji-
I ls! January 1987] 

Sltorl 1illt, rte. 
1.-(1) This Act may be cited as the Income Tax (Am~ndment) Act , 

1986. 
(2) In this Act the Income Tax Act is referred to as the principal Act. 

Commtnctl'ltnr 

2. This Act shall come into force on 1 January 1987. 

Basic Tox 
J. Section 6 of the principal Act is amended-

(a) by substituting the words "two thousand live hundred dollars" 
for the words "two thousand dollars" in sub-paragraph (i) of 
paragraph (a) of subsection (1); and 

(b) by substituting the words "two thousand five hundred dollars" 
for the words "two thousand dollars" wherever these words 
appear in paragraph (a) of subsection (2). 

Normal Ill% 

. 4. Section 7 of the principal Act is amended by substituting the words 
''.two thousand Jive hundred dolJars" for the words "two thousand dollars" 
- h.e,re!e , ~e:: wot,~~J1(: · :~1[j ~;, P,.~rnP~Pti-(~{ :~~.,~ll ~ect.io;, . ( [?:i., .:. . 



! .. : . I • 

444 

l11crcostd tt~mplion ill raptCI of ctrf~ ogrlculfu,al income 

s. Section 16 of the principal Act is amended by repealing sub
paragraph (ii) of paragraph (c) o( subsection (1) and substituting the 
following-

.. (ii) the income· (in this su~paragraph referred to as "prescribed 
farming income") derived by an individual from any other farming 
activity, including fishinJt and forestry but excluding cane farming, 
shall be exempt fTom normal tax for a period of 4 years commencing 
on 1 January 1987 subject to the conditions that the'individual shall 
deliver to the Commissioner a return of his total income in 
accordance with the provisions of this Act, and that if he has income 
other than prescribed farming income, such other income shall be 
liable to tax, and the prescribed farming income shall be exempt 
from normal tax at the average rate of normal tax applicable to the 
indiv.idual for the year of assessment; and for the purposes of this 
sub-paragraph the average rate of normal lax of the individual for 
the income year in question shall be the total nonnal tax payable by 
him for that income year divided by his total income (induding all 
exempt prescribed farming income) for that income year~". 

/nco,,ttJ not 1,uol,lt 

6. Section 17 of the principal Act is amended-
' (a) by substituting the words "four hundred dollars" for the words 

"two hundred dollars" wherever these _words appear in sub• 
paragraph (ii) of paragraph (8); 

(b) by substituting the words "five hundred dollars" for the words 
"four hundred dollars'' wherever these words appear in sub
paragraph (iii) of paragraph (8); 

(c) by substituting the words "five hundred dollars" for the words 
"four hundred dollars" in the proviso to paragraph (8); and 

(d) by repealing paragraph (48) and substituting the following
"(48) for a period of 3 years commencing on 1 ·January 
1987, the income, equivalent to the income on which rebate 
would be granted under paragraph S(i) of the Fifth 
Schedule, of a company which is engaged in the export of 
timber grown in Fiji.". 

7.-{1) Section 21 of the principal Act is amended by repealing 
paragraph (q) and substituting the (o\lowing-

"(q) such amount as is dep0$ited in an account approved by the 
Commissioner specifica\\y operated by any bank for the 
purp~e o( , providing a reserve against destruction of or 

• , : d~~a.Je._to ;ab·· i\~}~gs,\ua\ed i.n F..i ii caused by Windstorm, tidal ,.>w. .,. ,,. J/~t ,~:\•~~-:.~~~f.~(~"~~t ·, 

t i 

I 
I 
! 



Income Tax (Amendment)-25 of 1986 · 445 

(i) the deduction allowed shall not exceed in the case of a 
commercial, industrial or agricultural building 1.5 per
cent of the replacement cost, or in the case of a 
residential building the lesser of $500 or 1.5 per cent of 
the replacement cost, or the building in respect of which 
such account is operated ; 

(ii) any amount which is withdrawn from such account and 
not applied towards the repair of a building damaged by 
windstorm, tidal wave, landslide or a like catastrophe, 
shall be assessed, together with any interest thereon, in 
terms of paragraph (bb) of section 1 l. 

. In this paragraph "building" includes outbuildings, walls, gates, fences 
and such other ancillary structures as may be approved by the Commissi
oner, which are on the same premises as, and used in conneclion with, a 
principal building.". 

(2) The amendment made by subsection (1) shall be deemed to have 
come into force on 1 January 1986. 

7A. Section 36 of the principal Act is amended by substi tuting for the 
expression "1986 .. in subsection (3) the expression " 198r. 

Objtttion 10 as,nsmcnt 

8. Section 62 of the principal Act is amended-

(oJ by substituting for the words " twenty-one" in subsection (5) the 
words "thirty-five"; and 

(b) by adding immediately after subsection (5) the following 
subsection-

"(SA) Where, before the expiration of the time specified in a 
notice given under subsection (5), the person to whom the 
notice is given makes application in writing to the Commis
sioner lor an extension of that lime, the Commissioner may, in 
his discretion, extend that time for such period as he thinks fit 
and shall, as soon as practicable, give notice in writing to the 
applicant of his decision, and , where the time is so extended, a 
reference in this Act to the time specified in a notice given 
under subsection (S) shall be deemed to include a reference to 
that time as so extended." . 

fn,~,rs1 on 1011 •~/undJ 

9. Section 78 of the principal Act is amended by adding the following 
subsection immediately after subsection (3)-

"(4) Where a refund due 10 a person in respect o( an assessment is . 
· not made .within 6 months ofthe date of fumishi,ag of the rerurn of ·• 

· :.i•too/F•:i•.,..,....u \~t. ~ · · · · · · · · ~<;·~•4~!1/on••?O•~;;!"'.~•~.'c·o, ).>, ,; I 



~y~,,, .. .. '""VY1? ._, ... ....... , - ... •-•-•·--•••• ·• 
~ . . . . 

446 Income Ta.Y (A111e11dme11i)-25 of 1986 

amount of the iefund, calculated from the expiry of 6 months rrom 
the date of lodgement of such return to the date on which the refund 
is made, provided that the delay is entirely in the office of the 
Commissioner.". 

NOfflltJI ru ~tttral rt!lort lnc,taitd 

10. Section 101 of the principal Act is amended by substituting for the 
words "thirty dollars" wherever they appear in the section the words 
" seventy dollars''. 

E1port fncend•u 

11. The Fifth Schedule to the principal Act is amended-

( a) by adding the following sub-paragraph immediately after sub-
paragraph (iii) of par~graph S-
"(iv) where the Minister considers that .an approved product has 
not been adequately marketed o,•erseas and further government 
assistance is desirable to facilitate exports which will generate 
substantial foreign exchange earning.,;, he may by direction to 
the Commissioner extend the 8 year period referred to in 
subparagraph (i), upon such conditions as he thinks fit, by a 
period not exceeding 5 years."; and 

(b) by repealing the words "indigenous limper" wherever they 
appear in paragraph 8 and subslituting the words "timber grown 
in Fiji.". 

Passed by the House of Representatives this second day ofDe-:ember. in the year 
or our Lord one thousand. nine hundred and eighty-six. 

Passed by the Senate this tenth day or December, in the year of our Lord one 
thousand. nine hundred and eighty-six . 

•. :,• ~ ;,'~~:. ~Omll)~\ 'l'ti!\IU, SUV',, f'ijl-\986 ..... , .. :~ .. 

I ,-
\ 
i 
r 
! 
i 




